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parties to extend the comment period.
In response to these requests and to
ensure that all interested parties have
time to comment, the deadline for
transmittal of comments has been
extended to September 28, 1999.
Comments should be postmarked by
September 28, 1999, to ensure
consideration.

Issued in Washington, DC, this 3rd day of
September 1999.
William D. Magwood, IV,
Director, Office of Nuclear Energy, Science
and Technology.
[FR Doc. 99–23567 Filed 9–9–99; 8:45 am]
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September 3, 1999.
Take notice that on August 31, 1999,

ANR Pipeline Company (ANR),
tendered for filing as part of its FERC
Gas Tariff, Second Revised Volume No.
1, the following tariff sheets proposed to
become effective September 1, 1999:
Thirty-Eighth Revised Sheet No. 8
Thirty-Eighth Revised Sheet No. 9
Thirty-Seventh Revised Sheet No. 13
Forty-Sixth Revised Sheet No. 18

ANR states that the above-referenced
tariff sheets are being filed to implement
recovery of approximately $2.2 million
of above-market costs that are associated
with its obligations to Dakota
Gasification Company (Dakota). ANR
proposes a reservation surcharge
applicable to its Part 284 firm
transportation customers to collect
ninety percent (90%) of the Dakota
costs, and an adjustment to the
maximum base tariff rates of Rate
Schedule ITS and overrun rates
applicable to Rate Schedule FTS–2, so
as to recover the remaining ten percent
(10%). ANR also advises that the
proposed changes would decrease
current quarterly Above-Market Dakota
Cost recoveries from $2,368,566 to
$2,156,641.

Any person desiring to be heard or to
protest said filing should file a motion
to intervene or a protest with the
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission,
888 First Street, N.E., Washington, D.C.
20426, in accordance with Sections
385.214 or 385.211 of the Commission’s
Rules and Regulations. All such motions
or protests must be filed in accordance

with Section 154.210 of the
Commission’s Regulations. Protests will
be considered by the Commission in
determining the appropriate action to be
taken, but will not serve to make
protestants parties to the proceedings.
Any person wishing to become a party
must file a motion to intervene. Copies
of this filing are on file with the
Commission and are available for public
inspection in the Public Reference
Room. This filing may be viewed on the
web at http://www.ferc.fed.us/online/
rims.htm (call 202–208–2222 for
assistance).
David P. Boergers,
Secretary.
[FR Doc. 99–23540 Filed 9–9–99; 8:45 am]
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Take notice that on August 31, 1999,
Colorado Interstate Gas Company (CIG),
tendered for filing to become part of its
FERC Gas Tariff, First Revised Volume
No. 1, the tariff sheets listed in on
Appendix A to the filing, to be effective
October 1, 1999.

CIG states that the purpose of this
filing is to comply with its FERC Gas
Tariff, First Revised Volume No. 1,
Article 20.1 of the General Terms and
Conditions. CIG states these tariff sheets
reflect the requirements of its FERC Gas
Tariff, Article 20.1 and relates to gas
quality controls associated with
volumes which are delivered on CIG’s
‘‘Valley Line’’.

CIG states that copies of the filing
have been mailed to all affected
customers and state regulatory
commissions.

Any person desiring to be heard or to
protest said filing should file a motion
to intervene or a protest with the
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission,
88 First Street, NE, Washington, DC
20426, in accordance with Sections
385.214 or 385.211 of the Commission’s
Rules and Regulations. All such motions
or protests must be filed in accordance
with Section 154.210 of the
Commission’s Regulations. Protests will
be considered by the Commission in
determining the appropriate action to be
taken, but will not serve to make
protestants parties to the proceedings.

Any person wishing to become a party
must file a motion to intervene. Copies
of this filing are on file with the
Commission and are available for public
inspection in the Public Reference
Room. This filing may be viewed on the
web at http://www.ferc.fed.us/online/
rims.htm (call 202–208–2222 for
assistance).
David P. Boergers,
Secretary.
[FR Doc. 99–23537 Filed 9–9–99; 8:45 am]
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Take notice that on August 31, 1999,
Colorado Interstate Gas Company (CIG),
tendered for filing as part of its FERC
Gas Tariff, First Revised Volume No. 1,
Fourteenth Revised Sheet No. 11A,
reflecting a decrease in its fuel
reimbursement percentage for Lost,
Unaccounted-For and Other Fuel Gas
from 1.53% to 1.43%, reflecting an
increase in the fuel reimbursement
percentage for Transportation Fuel Gas
from 2.38% to 2.47%, and reflecting an
increase in the fuel reimbursement
percentage for Storage Fuel Gas from
1.29% to 1.32% effective October 1,
1999.

CIG states that copies of this filing
have been served on CIG’s jurisdictional
customers and public bodies.

Any person desiring to be heard or to
protest said filing should file a motion
to intervene or a protest with the
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission,
888 First Street, NE, Washington, DC
20426, in accordance with Sections
385.214 or 385.211 of the Commission’s
Rules and Regulations. All such motions
or protests must be filed in accordance
with Section 154.210 of the
Commission’s Regulations. Protests will
be considered by the Commission in
determining the appropriate action to be
taken, but will not serve to make
protestants parties to the proceedings.
Any person wishing to become a party
must file a motion to intervene. Copies
of this filing are on file with the
Commission and are available for public
inspection in the Public Reference
Room. This filing may be viewed on the
web at http://www.ferc.fed.us/online/
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